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Apple has registered several new iPad and Mac models with the Eurasian ... Apple's filings in the Eurasian database cover five
new iPads and five Macs. ... Obviously, all four of these products were indeed unveiled at the .... Apple has just registered a lot
of products with the Eurasian Economic ... However, most of these filings do not represent new products and are merely ... For
the Apple Watch, there are seemingly four previously-unseen .... Recent filings by the Eurasian Economic Commission (EEC)
strongly suggests Apple is close to revealing the Apple Watch "Series 4," by .... New Apple filings reveal dozens of unreleased
iPhones and Apple ... The latest example comes from the Eurasian Economic Commission, where Apple has filed several ...
There are also four new Apple Watch models listed as running ... Lastly, in terms of Macs, there are 11 new model numbers, but
these .... Apple recently submitted a number of new filings to the Eurasian Economic Commission (EEC). The unreleased
product that stands out is model A2289 and Apple detailed that it is a “portable personal computer” running macOS 10.15 in the
document that was filed the day before Christmas.. An array of new iPads and Macs could be just around the corner, as Apple
has just registered five new iPads and five new Macs with the Eurasian Economic. ... The evidence comes in the form of filings
with the EEC, which requires ... shows 10 products added to the database on Wednesday, with five new Mac ... 4 days ago..
Apple has seemingly registered several new products with the Eurasian Economic Commission, including a new Apple Watch
and MacBook Pro. ... First up, there are four unknown identifiers for Apple Watch: ... A new report has revealed Facebook's
plans to overhaul its Messenger app, an update .... Filing reveals new MacBook Pro with Magic Keyboard likely coming soon.
Monday ... Apple registration filing Eurasia reveals four new Macs. Wednesday .... As for the Mac, 11 model numbers have
been filed, but all of them have either ... seen in the Eurasian database in May, have also been re-registered. As per the report,
the new iPhone and Apple Watch models would very likely ... Eurasian Economic Commission filings have prematurely
revealed upcoming .... WWDC 2020. AirPods Pro. iPhone 12. iPhone SE 2. Apple Pro Display XDR. iPhone 11. iPhone 11
Pro. Mac Pro.. Apple has registered five unannounced Macs and five unannounced iPads with the EEC, ... Apple Eurasian
Regulatory Filing Indicates 5 New Macs, 5 New iPads ... Eurasian Filing Reveals 6 Apple Watch Series 4 Models.. Database
Reveals That Apple Has Registered A Bunch Of New Products ... If you're thinking about buying a new iPad, iPhone, Apple
Watch, or MacBook, you ... the Eurasian Economic Commission, it seems that Apple has filed for a ... but the new sighting
reveals at least four new models which are A1466, .... An array of new iPads and Macs could be just around the corner, as
Apple ... On July 4, Apple registered new tablets with model numbers A1876, A1934, ... suggested Apple may hold an event to
reveal new iPads and Macs in July, but ... In the past, Apple filed for EEC registrations roughly a month before .... ARM-
powered Mac: Coming in 2021, says Kuo ... Apple's latest EEC filing reveals five new iPad models are on the way ... More
iPads may be on the way in the coming months, after a collection of filings at the Eurasian ... indicate there are five model
numbers registered to Apple as devices running iPadOS .... The EEC listing also shows four new Apple Watch models running
watchOS 6. ... According to MacRumors, 11 model numbers of Mac have been filed. ... seen in the Eurasian database in May,
have also been re-registered.. Apple has registered new iPhone and Apple Watch models with the EEC just weeks ... There are
also four new Apple Watch models listed as running watchOS 6. ... Apple also filed 11 new Mac models to the EED, but all of
them have either ... Eurasian Economic Commission filings have prematurely revealed upcoming .... New Mac, or possibly the
MacBook Pro and iPad model numbers ... New MacBook Pro and iPad Model Numbers Possibly Registered by Apple in
Eurasia ... in the Regulatory Filing Coupled With Four New iPad Models – Apple Is ... by Apple (via Consomac) reveals that
there are five new MacBook Pro .... Four of the numbers currently don't have counterparts in Apple's Mac lineup....... The
listing reveals over a dozen new iPhone models running the latest ... and Mac model numbers with the Eurasian Economic
Commission, media has reported. ... as well as four new Apple Watch models listed as running watchOS 6, ... seen in the
Eurasian database in May, have also been re-registered.. As for the Mac, 11 model numbers have been filed, but all of them ...
first seen in the Eurasian database in May, have also been re-registered. As per the report, the new iPhone and Apple Watch
models would very ... Eurasian Economic Commission filings have prematurely revealed ... Fax: 971-4-2639207 f559db6386 
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